11-29 Bid Response Chart

IFB 11-29 Various Fleet Vehicles

Coalinga Platinum Platinum TEC of McConnell
ltem Description Hansel Ford Motors Chevrolet | Chevrolet | Oakland | Chevrolet
2WD Compact Regular
1 Cab Pickup (2each) No Bid $35,388.50 $33,144.42 | $34,326.24 | $34,805.90 | $36,896.59
Promp Pmt Discount $1,000.00 NA Alternate Bid NA NA
$34,388.50
Local Preference NA $32,812.98 | $33,982.98 NA NA
2WD Compact
Extended Cab Pickup
2 (2each) $31,263.33 $34,889.40 $34,364.26 $36,490.79 | $37,172.17
Promp Pmt Discount NA $1,000.00 NA NA NA
$33,889.40
Local Preference $30,950.70 NA $34,020.62 NA NA
4x4 Mid-Size Extended
3 Cab Pickup (1each) $25,857.08 $23,027.03 $23,348.19 $25,272.56 No Bid
Promp Pmt Discount NA $500.00 NA NA
$22,527.03
Local Preference $25,598.51 $23,114.71 NA
2WD Mid-Size
Extended Cab Pickup
4 (2each) $40,903.62 $36,304.24 $36,338.96 $38,113.52 No Bid
Promp Pmt Discount NA $1,000.00 NA NA
$35,304.24
Local Preference $40,494.59 $35,975.58 NA
2WD Small 4 Door SUV
5 (1each) No Bid $23,966.64 $23,635.71 $31,475.49 | $24,952.90
Promp Pmt Discount $500.00 NA NA NA
$23,466.64
Local Preference $23,399.36 NA NA
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Successful bidder




